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Chuck Noll won four Super Bowls and presided over one of the greatest football dynasties in history, the
Pittsburgh Steelers of the ‘70s. Later inducted into the Pro Football Hall of Fame, his achievements as a
competitor and a coach are the stuff of legend. But Noll always remained an intensely private and
introspective man, never revealing much of himself as a person or as a coach, not even to the players and
fans who revered him.

            Chuck Noll did not need a dramatic public profile to be the catalyst for one of the greatest
transformations in sports history. In the nearly four decades before he was hired, the Pittsburgh Steelers were
the least successful team in professional football, never winning so much as a division title. After Noll’s
arrival, his quiet but steely leadership quickly remolded the team into the most accomplished in the history of
professional football.  And what he built endured well beyond his time with the Steelers – who have
remained one of America’s great NFL teams, accumulating a total of six Super Bowls, eight AFC
championships, and dozens of division titles and playoff berths.

            In this penetrating biography, based on deep research and hundreds of interviews, Michael
MacCambridge takes the measure of the man, painting an intimate portrait of one of the most important
figures in American football history. He traces Noll’s journey from a Depression-era childhood in Cleveland,
where he first played the game in a fully integrated neighborhood league led by an African-American coach
and then seriously pursued the sport through high school and college.  Eventually, Noll played both
defensive and offensive positions professionally for the Browns, before discovering that his true calling was
coaching.  MacCambridge reveals that Noll secretly struggled with and overcame epilepsy to build the career
that earned him his place as “the Emperor” of Pittsburgh during the Steelers’ dynastic run in the 1970s, while
in his final years, he battled Alzheimer’s in the shelter of his caring and protective family.

            Noll’s impact went well beyond one football team. When he arrived, the city of steel was facing a
deep crisis, as the dramatic decline of Pittsburgh’s lifeblood industry traumatized an entire generation.
“Losing,” Noll said on his first day on the job, “has nothing to do with geography.” Through his calm,
confident leadership of the Steelers and the success they achieved, the people of Pittsburgh came to believe
that winning was possible, and their recovery of confidence owed a lot to the Steeler’s new coach. The
famous urban renaissance that followed can only be understood by grasping what Noll and his team meant to
the people of the city. The man Pittsburghers could never fully know helped them see themselves better.

            Chuck Noll: His Life’s Work tells the story of a private man in a very public job. It explores the
family ties that built his character, the challenges that defined his course, and the love story that shaped his
life. By understanding the man himself, we can at last clearly see Noll’s profound influence on the city,
players, coaches, and game he loved. They are all, in a real sense, heirs to the football team Chuck Noll built.
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From reader reviews:

Jason Urso:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't wish
do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Chuck Noll: His Life's Work. All type
of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Fred Dean:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their reader with their story or their
experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the information about
something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your kids, there
are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors these days always try to improve their talent in
writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is this Chuck Noll:
His Life's Work.

Thomas Rojas:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This specific book Chuck Noll: His Life's Work was vibrant and of
course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Chuck Noll: His Life's Work has many kinds or
style. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read
and believe you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are usually make you bored, any it
offers you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like
reading this.

Debbie Yarborough:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the update information of year to help year. As we
know those publications have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to
around the world. From the book Chuck Noll: His Life's Work we can have more advantage. Don't you to be
creative people? For being creative person must prefer to read a book. Merely choose the best book that
appropriate with your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this book Chuck Noll: His Life's
Work. You can more attractive than now.
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