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Teacher Dane Bernard is a gentle giant, loved by all at Summitville High School. He has a beautiful wife,
two kids, and an easy rapport with staff and students alike. But Dane has a secret, one he expects to keep
hidden for the rest of his life--he's gay.

But when he loses his wife, Dane finally confronts his attraction to men. And a new teacher, Seth Wolcott,
immediately catches his eye. Seth himself is starting over, licking his wounds from a breakup. The last thing
Seth wants is another relationship but when he spies Dane on his first day at Summitville High, his attraction
is immediate and electric.

As the two men enter into a dance of discovery and new love, they're called upon to come to the aid of
bullied gay student Truman Reid. Truman is out and proud, which not everyone at his small-town high
school approves of. As the two men work to help Truman ignore the bullies and love himself without
reservation, they all learn life-changing lessons about coming out, coming to terms, acceptance, heartbreak,
and falling in love.
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From reader reviews:

Alvin Shaw:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each guide has different aim or even goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. These
are reading whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who
don't like examining a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book whenever they found difficult
problem as well as exercise. Well, probably you will need this Big Love.

Christopher Forney:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you
don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you
have time? What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They have to answer that question
simply because just their can do this. It said that about book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
correct. Because start from on guardería until university need this Big Love to read.

Sherrie Beardsley:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information quicker to share. You
can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You can observe
that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you is Big Love
this book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This specific book was
represented how do the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer value to explain it is easy to
understand. The actual writer made some research when he makes this book. Honestly, that is why this book
suited all of you.

Kenneth Armstrong:

As we know that book is very important thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can
know everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This book Big Love was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to
add your knowledge about your scientific research competence. Some people has several feel when they
reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the
modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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