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Skidmore, Owings & Merrill, founded in 1936, is one of the largest and most influential architecture firms in
the world. SOM has long been known for innovation, experimentation, design excellence, and technical
mastery, for an abiding interest in the contributions that buildings can make to the life of cities, and for a
collaborative approach that extends to all aspects of the design and construction processes. This volume,
which presents work from the 1950’s and early 1960’s, reproduces a monograph first published in 1962.

In an age dominated by a few great architect-designers noted for their intensely personal art, the firm of
Skidmore, Owings & Merrill for twenty-five years has been a unique force in the building of the modern
city. This book is the first study of SOM’s unified but far-flung operations, of the architecture created by its
remarkable complex of designers and engineers working in all corners of the world. Containing photographs,
site and building plans, elevation drawings, and accompanying explanatory text, it shows clearly the
integrated and pioneering work of a great American firm.

From Lever House to the Chase Manhattan Bank, from Oak Ridge to the Inland Steel Headquarters, from a
school for the deaf to a rare-book library at Yale, SOM has achieved a high perfection in standards of
structural design, continually refined excellence of finish, and vitality and elegance of experimentation. But
it has done more than that. Eschewing convenient routine solutions, SOM has demonstrated that a large
organization need not be uniform, conservative, or schematized. In every aspect of the building process, in
every detail of design and execution, it has shown imaginative and experimental brilliance. The curtain walls
of Lever House, the exposed reinforced concrete ribs of other skyscrapers, the spatial organization and
lighting in their offices, the steel tetrahedrons of the Air Force Academy Chapel: these technological
innovations have virtually opened up a new esthetic and technique of modern architectural design.

SOM architects are not, however, only interested in the individual building. Persuading its clients of
responsibilities beyond the mere maintenance of structures they will occupy and use, SOM is itself dedicated
to solving the major architectural problem of our day: the re-creation of old, and creation of new, cities –
well planned, imaginative, and of innate and lasting distinction. The substance of this book illuminates the
manner in which Skidmore, Owings & Merrill has achieved that goal.
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From reader reviews:

Jay Burke:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare
time to take a wander, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed
SOM: Architecture of Skidmore, Owings & Merrill, 1950-1962? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You
know beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you
agree with the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Patricia Steele:

The book SOM: Architecture of Skidmore, Owings & Merrill, 1950-1962 make you feel enjoy for your spare
time. You may use to make your capable much more increase. Book can being your best friend when you
getting tension or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading through a book SOM:
Architecture of Skidmore, Owings & Merrill, 1950-1962 to get your habit, you can get more advantages, like
add your own capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You could know everything if
you like available and read a publication SOM: Architecture of Skidmore, Owings & Merrill, 1950-1962.
Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or some others. So , how do
you think about this book?

Jerry Ingle:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book SOM: Architecture of
Skidmore, Owings & Merrill, 1950-1962. All type of book is it possible to see on many solutions. You can
look for the internet resources or other social media.

Gerard Armstrong:

Is it an individual who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This SOM: Architecture of Skidmore,
Owings & Merrill, 1950-1962 can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of
date, spending your free time by reading in this brand new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
publications have than the others?
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