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Psychiatry today is not as advertised, as bestselling author Charles Whitfield describes in this scientifically
accurate new book. It exposes the pseudo science behind modern biological psychiatry that misdiagnoses
people who have painful emotional, psychological and behavioral symptoms as being “mentally ill” and then
mistreats them with toxic psychiatric drugs that don’t work well or make them worse. Dr Whitfield blows the
whistle on and names the culprits that promote bio-psychiatry for profit and control and explains why and
how to avoid their mind- and body- manipulations. Most of these culprits are the “Bigs,” which include Big
Pharma, Big Government, Big Insurance, Big Academia and Big Professional groups (as the American
Psychiatric Association, American Medical Association and the National Alliance on Mental Illness). Each
of the Bigs promotes and supports the misdiagnosis and mistreatment of what they call “mental illness,”
which Dr Whitfield documents is instead the painful effects of repeated childhood and later trauma, which he
explains in some detail. Throughout he describes how this major problem has developed and how to heal
from it.
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From reader reviews:

James Anderson:

This Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in
your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is definitely information inside this guide
incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get.
That Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill without we recognize teach the one who studying it become
critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't become worry Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill can bring
if you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in your
lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill having fine arrangement in
word along with layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Mary Christensen:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold
on guys this aren't like that. This Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill book is readable through you who
hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience
without leaving possibly decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer involving Not Crazy:
You May Not Be Mentally Ill content conveys objective easily to understand by many people. The printed
and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different available as it. So , do you still
thinking Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Nicholas Thiede:

The actual book Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make
sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. Tom
makes some research before write this book. That book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
scanning this book.

Amanda Young:

The reason? Because this Not Crazy: You May Not Be Mentally Ill is an unordinary book that the inside of
the book waiting for you to snap the item but latter it will jolt you with the secret the item inside. Reading
this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such awesome way makes the
content inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for
you for not hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot
of positive aspects than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical
thinking approach. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were you I will go to the publication store
hurriedly.
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