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Celebrate special occasions with the gift of God’s Word. Choose the perfect gift for any celebration in
life—from graduation, confirmation, and awards to family and friendships—with Thomas Nelson’s Gift
Bible. Select from a variety of colors and bindings, all featuring bright, clean, and easy-to-read pages.
Personalize your gift with the recipient’s name on the cover for a Bible that will be cherished for years to
come. Give the gift of God’s Word . . . beautiful meaning, quality craftsmanship, and a timeless treasure.

Features include: 

Presentation page●

Chapter headings●

Self-pronouncing text●

Words of Jesus in red●

One-year Bible reading plan●

Illustrated dictionary-concordance●

Full-color maps●

7-point type size●

Part of the CLASSIC SERIES line of Thomas Nelson Bibles

Gift Bibles sold to date: More than 235,000

The King James Version—The most successful Bible translation in history with billions of copies
published

Thomas Nelson Bibles is giving back through the God’s Word in Action program. Donating a portion of
profits to World Vision, we are helping to eradicate poverty and preventable deaths among children. Learn
more and discover what you can do at www.seegodswordinaction.com.
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From reader reviews:

Victor Brown:

This KJV, Gift Bible, Imitation Leather, Brown (Classic Series) is great guide for you because the content
that is certainly full of information for you who have always deal with world and get to make decision every
minute. This specific book reveal it info accurately using great arrange word or we can state no rambling
sentences in it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it
only gives you straight forward sentences but hard core information with splendid delivering sentences.
Having KJV, Gift Bible, Imitation Leather, Brown (Classic Series) in your hand like keeping the world in
your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no book that offer you world inside ten or
fifteen tiny right but this reserve already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs.
occupied do you still doubt in which?

William Grant:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. That KJV, Gift Bible, Imitation Leather, Brown (Classic
Series) can give you a lot of pals because by you checking out this one book you have thing that they don't
and make you more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of one step for you to get
success. This reserve offer you information that probably your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than
various other make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let us have KJV, Gift Bible, Imitation Leather,
Brown (Classic Series).

Emilie Lechner:

You can get this KJV, Gift Bible, Imitation Leather, Brown (Classic Series) by browse the bookstore or
Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it could to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties for the
knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only simply by written or printed and also can you
enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile
phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information
about your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still
revise. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

David Whetstone:

A lot of publication has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by internet on social media.
You can choose the best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is
known as of book KJV, Gift Bible, Imitation Leather, Brown (Classic Series). Contain your knowledge by it.
Without leaving behind the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It
is most important that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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