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A laugh-out-loud romance from the author of the bestselling YOU HAD ME AT HELLO

She kissed the groom. She’s not the bride…

Edie thought she’d found The One…until he told her he was marrying someone else. And on the day of his
wedding, when he kisses her, life really does go pear-shaped…

Labelled as a home-wrecker and office outcast, when her boss offers her the chance to get out of town Edie
jumps at it, even though moving back in with her eccentric father and prickly sister isn’t exactly the escape
she needs.

When her work throws her into the path of rising star and heartthrob Elliot, Edie is expecting a highly strung
diva. But as their unexpected friendship develops, Elliot isn’t the only one in the spotlight…

Who’s that girl? Edie is ready to find out.
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From reader reviews:

Keri Yokum:

The book Who's That Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky romcom! make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You
can use to make your capable much more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting
tension or having big problem together with your subject. If you can make studying a book Who's That
Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky romcom! for being your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your
own capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you
like start and read a reserve Who's That Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky romcom!. Kinds of book are several.
It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Thomas Carlson:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book entitled
Who's That Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky romcom! your head will drift away trough every dimension,
wandering in each aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely will become your mind friends. Imaging
each word written in a guide then become one type conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get just
before. The Who's That Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky romcom! giving you yet another experience more
than blown away your mind but also giving you useful information for your better life in this era. So now let
us teach you the relaxing pattern is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished
examining it, like winning a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time
activity?

Andre Botsford:

The book untitled Who's That Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky romcom! contain a lot of information on it.
The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so
do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read that. The book was authored by famous author. The author
brings you in the new time of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can read on your
smart phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to
purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

Lisa Chaffee:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. This Who's That Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky romcom! can give
you a lot of buddies because by you considering this one book you have issue that they don't and make an
individual more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success. This
publication offer you information that probably your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than additional
make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let us have Who's That Girl?: A laugh-out-loud sparky
romcom!.
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