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Angels and mortals mix in this whimsical tale about life and death with a light hearted peek behind the
scenes-at Heaven and the afterlife.

Harry Taylor, an American, is hit and killed by an errant SUV while on his evening jog. Harry meets
Barkley, his guarding angel, who apologizes, "I'm sorry, Harry, I tried to save you but there's only so much
an angel can do." "That's okay, I'm sure you did your best," Harry tells him, "May I call you Barkley?"

Harry has a special lady friend, Anne Summer. They met quite unconventionally at the Orange County Fair.
Anne had been widowed for thirteen years until she met Harry. Anne is devastated by Harry's death; they
had been planning a trip to England.

Escorted by Barkley, Harry arrives in Eternity only to discover he must return-"It's not yet your time," he is
told, "and no one may be admitted early." Even in Heaven there are rules. "But his body has been destroyed,"
points out Barkley. "How's that going to work? Harry was hit by a truck."

Angel Savonere is summoned and devises a plan. Harry is given the body of a stuffy Englishman living on a
large estate near London. Harry Taylor is now Bromley Carter, a wealthy wine merchant.

Humorous twists develop as the "dormant" happy-go-lucky Harry begins to intrude on staid and proper
Bromley.

>Disaster strikes as Harry's dormant spirit is prematurely fully awakened creating chaos.

"That's not supposed to happen, is it?" Barkley, Harry's guarding angel asks.

"It's a new procedure," Angel Savonere points out, "we have to expect some bugs."

Harry, his persona freed, immediately invites his family to visit. Angel Savonere restores order, but Bromley
is caught in the backlash resulting in amnesia. Bromley has no idea who Harry Taylor is; and Harry's
daughter, Sally and son, Joe can't figure out how Harry knew Bromley Carter. Bromley plays host when the
family arrives, hoping to find out "who in blazes Harry Taylor is."

The unthinkable happens, when Bromley falls in love with Sally, and Sally, who has just broken up with
boyfriend Peter, finds Bromley's attention as well as his lifestyle most attractive. Harry is terrified, "I can't
marry my daughter. What can I do?"

A horrified Barkley rushes to Heaven to find a solution. Angel Charlie is sent to defuse the disaster. Charlie,
posing as a motorcycle riding American actress whips up a plan to reunite Harry with his true love Anne and
Sally with Peter.

The story progresses as the intrepid Harry introduces the staid Bromley to an exciting new world. The story
moves between Heaven and Earth for an amusing view of both worlds. Throughout Bromley Carter's rather
dull life begins to grow more interesting as Harry continues to "take over." Meanwhile, Angel Savonere is



reluctant to act further because he fears permanent damage. "My hands are tied," he tells Barkley. "We've got
what we've got. We have to make it work,"

What happens will keep the reader amused and guessing as to the final outcome.
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From reader reviews:

Tony Caldwell:

Here thing why this particular Heaven Sake are different and trusted to be yours. First of all examining a
book is good nevertheless it depends in the content than it which is the content is as tasty as food or not.
Heaven Sake giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any guide out there but there is
no publication that similar with Heaven Sake. It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your own
personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you.
You can actually bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your means home by train. If you
are having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Heaven Sake in e-book can be your
alternate.

Christina Fitts:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Heaven Sake book is readable through you who hate the straight word style.
You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving possibly
decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer regarding Heaven Sake content conveys
thinking easily to understand by most people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it
just different by means of it. So , do you even now thinking Heaven Sake is not loveable to be your top
collection reading book?

Julio Rico:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Books can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their
story or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to
improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some research before they write with their book. One of
them is this Heaven Sake.

Lettie Perez:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source which filled update of
news. In this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social
similar to newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching
for the Heaven Sake when you necessary it?
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