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Dove Glitch is embarrassed about everything above her knees and below her belly button. When she has to
fill a delicate, embarrassing prescription the last thing she needs is a sexy-as-hell (and brand spanking new)
pharmacist behind the counter. Johnson Fitzwell’s first day of his dream career also happens to coincide with
the exact moment Dove needs her feminine meds filled. His glorious voice is way too loud–as in, he should
be counting down the hits with Ryan Seacrest kind of loud. Thanks to Johnson’s handsome face and
gorgeous jaw line, Dove dives headlong into her waking nightmare and asks for a vagina-scented cream.
How could she not fall for him? Dove's only active goal now is to get Johnson to kiss her right on the lips.
Either set. However, his horrible girlfriend is one of many obstacles preventing her from making that fantasy
a reality. When Dove defends Johnson in the most unhygienic, unconventionally gross way in the middle of
a crowded restaurant, their tender, slightly tantric relationship is off to a galloping, farting start. Each print
copy of this book will be dipped in holy water by my mom, and glared at by my father as he purses his lips.
Neither will help. So, drop your pants and turn to the left and cough. I hope you're not allergic to latex,
because it’s time to fill your prescription. Anally. Praise for Fire Down Below: "I'd like to remove myself
from this spam list." ~Teresa Mummert NYT Bestselling Author "No." ~Jamie McGuire #1 NYT Bestselling
Author "Do not read her next book. Trust me." Colleen Hoover #1 NYT Bestselling Author "I have not read
this book." ~ Aesta's Book Blog "If this book is anything like her crazy tweets, then we are too scared to read
it." ~ The Rock Stars of Romance Book Blog "Debra is the queen of s@!ts and giggles." ~ Tijan NYT
Bestselling Author "Crap. Why won't you go away?" K.A. Robinson NYT Bestselling Author "You couldn't
pay me enough." Tara Sue Me NYT Bestselling Author "You can't be serious." JM Darhower USA Today
Bestselling Author "That's a big, tall glass of nope." Angie Lynch CEO and President of Shameless Book
Club "This book is about as cringe-worthy as a raging UTI." Helena Hunting Amazing Author "This book
gave my vagina nightmares for a week. What the hell was Debra thinking?!" ~Leisa Rayven Amazing
Author "I like to read Debra's work on the crapper in case I run out of toilet paper." CJ Roberts NYT
Bestselling Author "I've had the worst gas since I read Debra Anastasia's latest. Rip, full, wretched gas that
singes my butt hairs on the way out. A week later I'm still walking funny." Kendall Grey Amazing Author
"This cover gives me vaginal discomfort. Someone pass the Monistat." Tara Sivec NYT Bestselling Author
"I might read this book if I wasn't so afraid of catching something." Tina Reber NYT Bestselling Author "It
itches so bad." Ella Fox USA Today Bestselling Author "Can I un-read this? No? Do you have holy water so
I can wash my eyes?" - King Midian “Is this the gas lady with the flatulence problem that can do the bubble
tricks with her vagina?” Totally Booked Blog “Never Again. Disappointed! And just like Tony, I don’t like
to be disappointed.” Aleatha Romig NYT Bestselling Author “Penivores and Vagitarians both agree. It made
them vomit a little in their mouths.” Georgia Cates NYT Bestselling Author “This book smells like grilled
cheese and sadness.” Mary Elizabeth Amazing Author “Enough to cause a burning ring of fire. Please
Debra…just stop!” Belle Aurora USA Today Bestselling Author “The only way fire should be associated
with this book is if it was actually on fire. Burning in my fireplace.” Jillian from Read-Love-Blog “Who is
this woman and why is she talking to me?” Tabatha Vargo NYT Bestselling Author “Is she writing about
hairy vaginas or explosive diarrhea?” Neda from The Sub Club “This book caused my anus to grow a steel-
plated hymen.” Shay Savage USA Today “Save your receipt.” Liv Morris Amazing Author
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From reader reviews:

Debbie Davis:

This Fire Down Below (Gynazule) (Volume 1) usually are reliable for you who want to become a successful
person, why. The key reason why of this Fire Down Below (Gynazule) (Volume 1) can be one of several
great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple studying food but feed you actually
with information that possibly will shock your previous knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can
bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this Fire
Down Below (Gynazule) (Volume 1) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that could it useful in your day action. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Luther Brown:

The reserve with title Fire Down Below (Gynazule) (Volume 1) includes a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding
the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is important
to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you inside new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Jon Pittenger:

This Fire Down Below (Gynazule) (Volume 1) is great guide for you because the content which can be full
of information for you who have always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This
specific book reveal it info accurately using great arrange word or we can point out no rambling sentences
inside it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides
straight forward sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Fire
Down Below (Gynazule) (Volume 1) in your hand like having the world in your arm, facts in it is not
ridiculous one particular. We can say that no book that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but
this e-book already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt which?

Robert Quinonez:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need
to know that reading is very important and also book as to be the point. Book is important thing to
incorporate you knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update
concerning something by book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you go onto be your object.
One of them is actually Fire Down Below (Gynazule) (Volume 1).
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