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The monster battleships Kirishima and Washington battled thunderously in the Solomon Islands during
World War II. At Jutland and Dogger Bank in World War I, long lines of battleships, battle cruisers, and
cruisers exchanged salvoes, sinking and being sunk. In Korea, U.S. cruisers and battleships provided
continuous bombardment of the Communist lines. In fact, since 1861, armored warships have been slamming
out shells in every naval war on record. But it all started in 1861. And it started off Norfolk and at New
Orleans and on the Mississippi, in the Carolina Sounds and at Mobile Bay. It started, in other words, in
America. Here, skillfully told, is the story of our first armored navies. North and South, Confederate and
Union, the rams and the monitors, the tin-clads and the "torpedo" boats. All of these ships changed the naval
history of the world. Here is Ericsson, the brilliant, cantankerous designer of the Monitor, and acid Admiral
DuPont, who couldn't take Charleston. Meet Alban C. Stimers, proclaimed the world's greatest engineer (by
himself) and the gallant Confederate Buchanan, who would fight any odds. And many more. Plus, of course,
the ships. The artist-author has illustrated his work with superb line drawings, plans and breakdowns, which
illustrate every word of the text. Detailed maps illustrate the various ironclad battles. Here are the immortals,
Monitor and Virginia (nee Merrimac), the gallant Tennessee, the Eads gunboats, the weird Keokuk - every
major type of ironclad design from 1861 to 1865. This is an American book, for sailors, for would-be sailors,
for historians, and for engineers. It is a fragment of history in imperishable pictures and prose.
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Nathanson:

The book Civil War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare
time. You should use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can for being your best friend
when you getting strain or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make studying a book
Civil War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add
your personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You are able to know everything
if you like start and read a book Civil War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor. Kinds of book are several.
It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this guide?

Isaias McGee:

The publication untitled Civil War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor is the guide that recommended to
you to read. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to anyone. The language that
writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of
research when write the book, therefore the information that they share to your account is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of Civil War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor from the publisher
to make you far more enjoy free time.

John Moreno:

This Civil War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor is great publication for you because the content that is
certainly full of information for you who all always deal with world and get to make decision every minute.
That book reveal it facts accurately using great manage word or we can point out no rambling sentences
included. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only provides you
with straight forward sentences but hard core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Civil
War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor in your hand like getting the world in your arm, details in it is not
ridiculous a single. We can say that no guide that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this
publication already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt
that will?

Rose Heck:

As a college student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even
make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart or real
their passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As
we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this Civil War Ironclads: The Dawn of Naval Armor can make you experience
more interested to read.
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